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Azra Nakicevic, CPA

Azra joined GBQ in 2018 with 
over 17 years of Big 4 experience 
providing tax planning and 
compliance services to clients in 
a variety of industries including 
construction, retail, private equity, 
hospitality and asset management.

Azra is a subject matter expert in 
pass through-entities (partnerships 
and S corporations) and individual 
taxation with a strong focus in the 
real estate industry. Additionally, 
she has provided an active 
consulting role to clients in choice 
of entity, complex income and 
loss allocations, troubled debt 
restructuring, like-kind exchanges, 
tax credits, involuntary conversions 
and structuring related to merger 
and acquisitions of businesses.

Prior to joining GBQ, Azra led 
and oversaw operations in India 
for the region and professional 
development of 400 professionals. 

Education
Bluffton University
B.B.A., Accounting and Business 
Administration

Professional Associations
• American Institute of Certified Public 

Accountants
• The Ohio Society of Certified Public 

Accountants


